

CTE FURNITURE BID Bids are under review pending recommendation to the Joint Building Committee
Bid Opening: March 6, 2019

COMPANY	Qty.	K-LOG		CRITERIA II LTD.		SCHOOL SPECIALTY INC.		ROBERT H. LORD		VIRCO INC.		W.B. MASON			SCHOOL FURNISHINGS			SCHOOL FURNISHINGS ALTERNATE BID			CASCADE			CREATIVE OFFICE PAVILION				
		Price Each	Total	Price Each	Total	Price Each	Total	Price Each	Total	Price Each	Total	Price Each	Total	Notes	Price Each	Total	Notes	Price Each	Total	Notes	Price Each	Total	Notes	Price Each	Total	Notes		
1. Student Desks, 24" X 60"	35	\$374.35	\$13,102.25			\$360.00	\$12,600.00			NO BID				\$208.00	\$7,280.00		\$381.26	\$13,344.10		\$227.50	\$7,962.50		\$169.27	\$5,924.45		\$225.21	\$7,882.35	
2. Student Desks, 24" X 48"	40	\$341.45	\$13,658.00			\$319.00	\$12,760.00			NO BID				\$179.50	\$7,180.00		\$340.72	\$13,628.80		\$216.88	\$8,675.20		\$169.27	\$6,770.80		\$214.73	\$8,589.20	
3. Student tables, 30" X 60"	41	\$379.05	\$15,541.05			\$380.00	\$15,580.00			NO BID				\$218.00	\$8,938.00		\$425.21	\$17,433.61		\$252.50	\$10,352.50		\$221.22	\$9,070.02		\$249.86	\$10,244.26	
4. Training tables, 30" X 60"	22	NO BID				\$150.00	\$3,300.00			NO BID				\$237.00	\$5,214.00		NO BID			\$566.61	\$12,465.42		NO BID			\$689.45	\$15,167.90	
5. Computer desks, 24" X 48"	38	\$328.70	\$12,490.60			\$205.00	\$7,790.00			NO BID				\$664.95	\$25,268.10		NO BID			\$471.16	\$17,904.08		NO BID			\$541.73	\$20,585.74	
6. Computer tables, 30" X 72"	1	\$570.61	\$570.61			\$217.00	\$217.00			NO BID				\$290.04	\$290.04		NO BID			\$349.99	\$349.99		NO BID			NO BID		
7. Varidesk Pro Plus 36"	2	NO BID				NO BID				NO BID				\$540.28	\$540.28		NO BID			\$339.46	\$339.46		NO BID			NO BID		
8. Studio Table	1	\$749.39	\$749.39			NO BID				NO BID				\$885.20	\$885.20		NO BID			\$386.18	\$386.18		NO BID			NO BID		
9. Collaborative Desks	58	\$337.09	\$19,551.22			NO BID				NO BID				\$949.60	\$949.60		NO BID			\$885.20	\$885.20		NO BID			NO BID		
10. Work table, 36" X 72"	2	\$471.39	\$942.78			\$453.00	\$906.00			NO BID				\$326.75	\$18,951.50		\$300.85	\$17,449.30		\$242.32	\$14,054.56		NO BID			\$191.37	\$11,099.46	
11. Science Tables, 24" X 48"	1	\$350.39	\$350.39			NO BID				NO BID				\$480.00	\$480.00		\$951.18	\$951.18		\$633.56	\$633.56		\$507.90	\$507.90		NO BID		
12. Half Moon table	1	NO BID				NO BID				NO BID				\$371.00	\$371.00		\$490.13	\$490.13		\$257.50	\$257.50		NO BID			\$261.64	\$261.64	
13. Round table 48"	1	\$451.39	\$451.39			\$641.00	\$641.00			NO BID				\$312.00	\$312.00		\$469.54	\$469.54		\$280.00	\$280.00		\$282.70	\$282.70		\$283.84	\$283.84	
14. Round Table 36"	4	\$411.39	\$1,645.56			\$453.00	\$1,812.00			NO BID				\$238.00	\$952.00		\$433.64	\$1,734.56		\$258.20	\$1,032.80		\$244.07	\$976.28		\$272.12	\$1,088.48	
15. Square Dining Tables	15	NO BID				NO BID				NO BID				\$609.85	\$9,147.75		\$608.12	\$9,121.80			\$0.00		NO BID			\$230.82	\$3,462.30	
16. Snack Tables	2	\$212.40	\$424.80			NO BID				NO BID				\$198.50	\$397.00		NO BID			\$180.75	\$361.50		\$296.47	\$592.94		NO BID		
17. Folding tables, 30" X 60"	8	\$294.47	\$2,355.76			NO BID				NO BID				\$297.50	\$2,380.00		NO BID			\$221.96	\$1,775.68		\$203.13	\$1,625.04		\$289.93	\$2,319.44	
18. Folding tables, 36" X 60"	6	NO BID				NO BID				NO BID				\$398.50	\$2,391.00		NO BID			\$253.40	\$1,520.40		NO BID			\$289.93	\$1,739.58	
19. Conference Table	2	\$1,568.60	\$3,137.20			NO BID				NO BID				\$1,195.00	\$2,390.00		\$1,374.28	\$2,748.56			\$0.00		NO BID			\$2,009.67	\$4,019.34	
20. Conference Chairs	25	NO BID				\$179.00	\$4,475.00			\$199.39	\$4,984.75			\$65.30	\$1,632.50		\$98.86	\$2,471.50			\$0.00		\$309.74	\$7,743.50		\$388.93	\$9,723.25	
21. Breakaway Conf. Table 6 Items combined	1	NO BID				NO BID				NO BID				\$6,137.40	\$6,137.40		\$6,691.00	\$6,691.00			\$0.00		NO BID			NO BID		
22. Conference Chairs (Qty listed as 6 on bid sheet)	12	NO BID				\$179.00	\$2,148.00			\$199.39	\$2,392.68			\$65.30	\$783.60		\$98.86	\$1,186.32			\$0.00		\$309.74	\$3,716.88		\$388.93	\$4,667.16	
23. Waiting Chairs	2	NO BID				\$107.00	\$214.00			\$146.21	\$292.42			\$140.90	\$281.80		\$171.99	\$343.98		\$143.82	\$287.64		\$183.02	\$366.04		\$255.49	\$510.98	
24. Science Bench on casters	6	\$556.60	\$3,339.60			NO BID				\$576.69	\$3,460.14			\$471.80	\$2,830.80		\$533.98	\$3,203.88			\$0.00		NO BID			NO BID		
25. Wood top work bench 60" X 30"	8	\$500.19	\$4,001.52			NO BID				NO BID				\$1,035.30	\$8,282.40		\$584.26	\$4,674.08		\$424.03	\$3,392.24		NO BID			NO BID		
26A. 30" X 60" table	12	\$350.09	\$4,201.08			NO BID				NO BID				\$1,693.05	\$20,316.60		\$391.57	\$4,698.84			\$0.00		NO BID			NO BID		
26B. 30" X 50" table	9	NO BID				NO BID				NO BID				\$1,671.00	\$15,039.00		\$524.47	\$4,720.23			\$0.00		NO BID			NO BID		
27. Work Bench, computer	8	NO BID				NO BID				NO BID				\$1,850.00	\$14,800.00		\$424.03	\$3,392.24		\$445.28	\$3,562.24		NO BID			NO BID		
28. Work bench automotive	10	NO BID				NO BID				\$739.60	\$7,396.00			\$664.50	\$6,645.00		\$664.71	\$6,647.10			\$0.00		NO BID			NO BID		
29. Instructor desk	3	\$741.00	\$2,223.00			\$840.00	\$2,520.00			\$667.10	\$2,001.30			\$727.75	\$2,183.25		NO BID			\$583.72	\$1,751.16		\$916.87	\$2,750.61		NO BID		
30. Instructor Desks	6	\$475.00	\$2,850.00			\$588.00	\$3,528.00			\$348.81	\$2,092.86			\$453.25	\$2,719.50		NO BID			\$378.94	\$2,273.64		NO BID			NO BID		
31. L Shaped Instructor Desks	2	NO BID				\$1,233.00	\$2,466.00			NO BID				\$258.50	\$517.00		NO BID			\$1,148.00	\$2,296.00		NO BID			\$1,402.05	\$2,804.10	
32. Student Chairs	255	\$67.71	\$17,266.05			\$39.00	\$9,945.00			\$34.70	\$8,848.50			\$54.65	\$13,935.75		NO BID			\$49.32	\$12,576.60		NO BID			\$92.60	\$23,613.00	
33. Stackable Chairs	60	NO BID				NO BID				NO BID				\$298.65	\$17,919.00		\$280.30	\$16,818.00			\$0.00		NO BID			\$344.67	\$20,680.20	
34A. Flex Tiered Steps	10	NO BID				NO BID				\$997.46	\$9,974.60			\$2,393.70	\$23,937.00		\$1,446.15	\$14,461.50			\$0.00		NO BID			NO BID		
34B. Chairs	4	NO BID				NO BID				\$475.57	\$1,902.28			\$1,619.50	\$6,478.00		\$1,467.00	\$5,868.00		\$1,339.71	\$5,358.84		NO BID			\$1,498.67	\$5,994.68	
34C. Benches	6	NO BID				NO BID				\$764.88	\$4,589.28			\$744.60	\$4,467.60		\$869.48	\$5,216.88			\$0.00		NO BID			NO BID		
34D. Stools	10	NO BID				NO BID				NO BID				\$326.80	\$3,268.00		NO BID			\$280.90	\$2,809.00		NO BID			NO BID		
34E. Tables	4	NO BID				NO BID				NO BID				\$1,137.25	\$4,549.00		NO BID			\$471.20	\$1,884.80		NO BID			\$477.87	\$1,911.48	
35. Heavy Duty Chairs	4	NO BID				NO BID				NO BID				\$63.15	\$252.60		\$92.10	\$368.40			\$0.00		\$62.86	\$251.44		\$530.67	\$2,122.68	
36. Task Chairs	31	\$123.99	\$3,843.89			\$124.00	\$3,844.00			\$161.56	\$5,008.36			\$129.20	\$4,005.20		NO BID			\$146.08	\$4,528.48		NO BID			\$288.27	\$8,936.37	
37. High Task Chairs	2	\$285.50	\$571.00			\$156.00	\$312.00			\$182.35	\$364.70			\$192.50	\$385.00		NO BID			\$240.77	\$481.54		NO BID			\$205.58	\$411.16	
38. Lab Stools	115	\$97.79	\$11,245.85			\$94.00	\$10,810.00			\$79.70	\$9,165.50			\$67.50	\$7,762.50		\$76.85	\$8,837.75			\$0.00		\$48.70	\$5,600.50		\$71.03	\$8,168.45	